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Group D has duty this week 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Please Release The Following 

 ALL Girls Tennis 

@ 1:15 

Dual Language is celebrating Latinx Heritage Month:  DID 
YOU KNOW - Did you know that Cesar Chavez was a 
devoted vegetarian? 
 
 
 
 
Attention Students:  Be advised, attendance at the S.V. vs 
B.P. Football game is a privilege.  Students who have been 
suspended this year or who have 20 unexcused tardies and 
absences may not attend. 
 
The Kaiser Permanente Educational Outreach Programs 
brings to the S.V.H.S. campus “Mindful Mondays” starting 
Monday, October 10th.  The session will be provided by 
one of their clinicians to bring the practice and 
understanding of Mindfulness to students before you get 
too busy.  The practices are open to all students who are 
interested.  Stop by Room 321 at 8:00am for a 15-20 minute 
practice and discussion on the benefits of being present and 
develop you own understanding of how the practice of self-
awareness brings so many benefits.  If you are new to 
mindfulness, than this is perfect for you.  If you are a 
seasoned student who likes to practice mindfulness than 
come and join us to share your knowledge.  If you have any 
questions, please just stop by and check it out. 

Girls JV & Varsity Tennis vs Gladstone 
  @ Sierra Vista - 2:15 
 
 
 
 
 

Sports 

Chess Club has a meeting TODAY in Room 610 at Lunch.  
All are welcome to join! 
 
 
 
 

Clubs & Activities 

SENIORS:  Time is running out to take your senior  
portraits.  Make-ups will not happen on campus this year.  
The only way to secure your portrait in the yearbook is to 
go to the studio and take your yearbook portrait.  You must 
call PSS Imaging to book an appointment.  Hurry because 
they are running out of slots quickly!  You must take your 
portrait by October 30th to be included in the yearbook.  
See our Instagram @yearbook.svdons for more details or 
ask Mr. Garcia for more information. 


